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NEWSLETTER 5 – Friday, 11th of November 2022 

 

Dear Parents, 

 

Thank you to everyone who made the Remembrance Service such a poignant event. The children 
were outstanding in their manner, readings and conduct as they followed the school’s core values 
of Thankfulness and Respect. 

 

 

 

Well done to the School’s Dodgeball Team who competed at the Regional finals this week finishing 
runners-up at the regionals and picking up the silver medal narrowly missing out on 1st place by 
one point. Good luck next week to the Year 5/6 Football Team who compete at County Finals, the 
Year 3/4 Football Team who compete at local finals and the school cross-country team who 
compete the week after next. Well done to all those children who are working hard with their 
clarinet and violins, my music teachers tell me you are progressing brilliantly, and thank-you 
parents for persevering with this as well! 

 

In other news, the PTA had their AGM this week and they are planning a number of events for the 
children over the next few months, more information to follow. Thank you to all involved in the 
recent Parent-Governor elections, and congratulations to Matthew Scorer on his re-election. 

 

Any volunteers who can spare a little time for the school (you don’t have be a committee member!) 
please contact them through their Facebook page. Thank you also to the PTA for donating the 
£1200 for the tickets for the pantomime where we are taking the whole school and thank you 
especially to a private donor who has personally donated £900 for the transport for this event. This 
person wants to remain anonymous but you know who you are! 



 

In celebration of the World Cup and our global community, the next non-uniform day will be on 
Monday the 21st of November (donations to the PTA of chocolate and bottles for the hampers 
would be great). The theme will be the World Cup or any sporting heroes from around the world. 
Face paint is allowed! 

 

Best Wishes 

 

Mr Bertram 

     

 

 

 

I thought I would remind everyone of the school’s core values in developing our children to where 
they are going to be at the age of 25: 

Resilience 

Compassion 

Trust 

Entrepreneurial spirit 

Environmentally aware 

Keeping Safe 

STEM (Science, Technology, Engineering and Maths) 

Respect 

Thankfulness 

Friendship 

 

Autumn Term Dates- 

November 

11th Remembrance Service 9:30am 

14th Theme- Resilience 

18th Children in Need- Spots and Stripes Day (Own donations) 

21st Non-Uniform Day- World Cup Theme 

21st Theme- Friendship 

28th Theme- Respect 

 

 

 

December 

1st Flu Vaccinations 



2nd Christmas Tree Lighting 

5th Theme- Entrepreneurial Spirit 

5th Year 6 choir at Lyme Park 

7th EYFS Nativity 9:30am 

7th Year 1/2 Nativity 1:30pm 

12th Theme- Compassion 

13th Key Stage 2 Carol Service- 6pm 

14th Little Conkers Walk to Whaley Bridge 

15th Pantomime- Sleeping Beauty- Whole School Trip 

19th Theme- Keeping Safe 

 

SAFEGUARDING is very important to us as a school. The Designated Lead at the School is Mr 
Bertram if you have any concerns about a child in our area please don’t hesitate to contact him 
for advice.  Safeguarding is everyone’s responsibility. 

 I have also located a useful one stop shop of mental health support sights if anyone should 
require the need. Mental health resources for children, students, parents, carers and 
school/college staff - The Education Hub (blog.gov.uk) 

As you are no doubt probably aware there has already been a spike in the number of illness in 
some of our local schools. I will you up to date with the latest government advice from Public 
Health England with regards to Coronavirus. I have listed below the current expectations from 
government with regards to protocols on prevention and school attendance should your child 
come down with symptoms, there are also useful links should you require more information, you 
can see these below: 

 

 

                                        


